FAMIAESTY\ESTY 026.XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 1806 .

OFFERED BY Ms. ESTY OF CONNECTICUT | ,
~ And Me Bonantici of Cregon

In section 401(a)(1), strike “$933,700,000” and in-
sert “$1,104,700,0007.

In section 401(a)(2)(C)—

(1) strike  “$130,000,000” and insert -
“$996 000,000”;
| (2). strike  “$125,000,000” and  insert
“$141 ,000,000”; and

(3)  strike  “$5,000,000”  and  insert
“$150,000,000”.

In section 401(b)(1), strike “$933,700,000” and in-
sert ““$1,104,700,0007..

In section 401(b){(2){C)—

(1) strike  “$130,000,000” and  insert
“$296,000,0007;

(2)  strike  “$125,000,000”  and  insert
“$141,000,000°"; and

(3)  strike  “$5,000,000”  and  insert
“$150,000,000”.

FAWHLC\O42115\042115.004.ant (59852712)
April 21, 2015 (9:04 a.m.}




